
THE CORPORATION OF THE MUNICIPALITY 

OF KILLARNEY 

Regular Meeting of Council 

In Person/ZOOM 

Municipal Council Chambers 

July 9th , 2025 

5:00 P.M. 

PRESENT: MAYOR:                     Michael Reider      

                       COUNCILLORS:      Peggy Roque        Mary Bradbury     

                                                            Nikola Grubic      Robert Campbell      
    
ABSENT:      COUNCILLOR:        Dave Froats                                           

DISCLOSURE:                               Nil 

STAFF:          Clerk-Treasurer – Candy Beauvais 

                       Deputy Clerk-Treasurer – Gilles Legault 

                       Public Works Superintendent – Tony Nuziale 

                       Administrative Assistant – Angie Nuziale 

                       Tax/Utility Clerk – Julie Solomon 

                       Project Coordinator – Sanket Shinde 

                       Chief Building Official – Andrea Tarini 

                                                                                                                                                                    

MEMBERS OF PUBLIC:         0 (In Person)/ 0 (ZOOM)      

                                                                                     

GUESTS:                                      Nil 

DELEGATION: Nil 

Mayor Reider called meeting to order at 5:00 P.M., proceeded with roll call and 

acknowledged meeting on aboriginal land. 

Mayor called for a moment of silence and then proceeded to ask Council if there were any 

declarations of pecuniary interest. Each councillor announced they had no disclosure. 

Mayor indicated there was no delegation on the agenda. 

25-230    BY    ROBERT CAMPBELL – PEGGY ROQUE 

BE IT RESOLVED THAT the minutes of the Regular Meeting of Council held 

June 11th, 2025 be adopted as circulated. 

Resolution Result Recorded Vote 

Council Members 

Mary Bradbury 

Robert Campbell 

Dave Froats 

Nikola Grubic 

Michael Reider 

Peggy Roque 

YES NO 

□

□

□

□

□

□

CARRIED 

DEFEATED 

TABLED 

RECORDED VOTE (SEE RIGHT) 

PECUNIARY INTEREST DECLARED 

WITHDRAWN 

25-231    BY   PEGGY ROQUE – ROBERT CAMPBELL 

                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                 

BE IT RESOLVED THAT Disbursement Sheet #2025-06 covering the 

expenditures for the period ending June 30th , 2025 in the following amounts: 

General Expenses - $    546,187.66 
Payroll   Expenses - $     68,470.31 

are hereby approved for payment. 
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Resolution Result Recorded Vote 

Council Members 

Mary Bradbury 

Robert Campbell 

Dave Froats 

Nikola Grubic 

Michael Reider 

Peggy Roque 

YES NO 

□

□

□

□

□

□

CARRIED 

DEFEATED 

TABLED 

RECORDED VOTE (SEE RIGHT) 

PECUNIARY INTEREST DECLARED 

WITHDRAWN 

25-232    BY ROBERT CAMPBELL – PEGGY ROQUE 

                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                   

BE IT RESOLVED THAT the Municipality of Killarney supports Resolution 
No. C-2025-155 passed by the Township of Georgian Bay on June 2nd , 2025 - 

the Floating Accommodations – Position Paper (April 2025) and its 

recommendations; and 

FURTHER THAT this resolution be forwarded to all those noted in the 
resolution passed by the Township of Georgian Bay to express support and 

encourage coordinated advocacy. 

Resolution Result Recorded Vote 

Council Members 

Mary Bradbury 

Robert Campbell 

Dave Froats 

Nikola Grubic 

Michael Reider 

Peggy Roque 

YES NO 

□

□

□

□

□

□

CARRIED 

DEFEATED 

TABLED 

RECORDED VOTE (SEE RIGHT) 

PECUNIARY INTEREST DECLARED 

WITHDRAWN 

25-233 BY PEGGY ROQUE – ROBERT CAMPBELL 

WHEREAS O. Reg. 343/22 mandates firefighter certification under the Fire 

Protection and Prevention Act, 1997; and 

AND WHEREAS these mandatory certification requirements pose significant 
challenges for small rural and northern municipalities due to limited financial 

and training resources and reliance on volunteer fire departments; 

AND WHEREAS the implementation of these requirements without additional 

flexibility or support may negatively impact the Municipality’s ability to recruit 
and retain volunteer firefighters and provide adequate fire protection to its 

residents; 

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED THAT the Municipality of 
Killarney supports Resolution No. 2025-214 passed by the Township of Black 
River-Matheson on June 10th , 2025 opposing the regulation in its current form; 

and 

FURTHER THAT this resolution be forwarded to all those noted in the 
resolution passed by the Township of Black River-Matheson for their 
consideration and support. 

                       Note: Councillor Campbell abstained from voting. 

Resolution Result Recorded Vote 

Council Members 

Mary Bradbury 

Robert Campbell 

Dave Froats 

Nikola Grubic 

Michael Reider 

Peggy Roque 

YES NO 

□

□

□

□

□

□

CARRIED 

DEFEATED 

TABLED 

RECORDED VOTE (SEE RIGHT) 

PECUNIARY INTEREST DECLARED 

WITHDRAWN 
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25-234    BY PEGGY ROQUE – ROBERT CAMPBELL 

BE IT RESOLVED THAT the Municipality process the following Minutes of 
Settlement made under the Municipal Act, 2001 for the following property: 

For the Year 2025 – 357 Application 

Roll #5136 000 012 10300 0000 residential assessment write-off (RT) in the 

amount of ($160,000) For the Period: January 1, 2025 to December 31, 2025. 

Reason: Updated Structure Data 

Resolution Result Recorded Vote 

Council Members 

Mary Bradbury 

Robert Campbell 

Dave Froats 

Nikola Grubic 

Michael Reider 

Peggy Roque 

YES NO 

□

□

□

□

□

□

CARRIED 

DEFEATED 

TABLED 

RECORDED VOTE (SEE RIGHT) 

PECUNIARY INTEREST DECLARED 

WITHDRAWN 

25-235    BY    ROBERT CAMPBELL – PEGGY ROQUE 

WHEREAS the City of Guelph has raised concerns that provisions in Bill 5 and 

Bill 17 weaken environmental protections and override municipal planning 
authority; 

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED THAT the Municipality of 
Killarney supports the Resolution passed by the City of Guelph on June 10th , 

2025 opposing these provisions and urges the Province of Ontario to uphold 
sound environmental planning principles, respect municipal authority, honour 

Indigenous treaty obligations, and protect ecological systems; 

FURTHER THAT this resolution be forwarded to all those noted in the 

resolution passed by the City of Guelph. 

Resolution Result Recorded Vote 

Council Members 

Mary Bradbury 

Robert Campbell 

Dave Froats 

Nikola Grubic 

Michael Reider 

Peggy Roque 

YES NO 

□

□

□

□

□

□

CARRIED 

DEFEATED 

TABLED 

RECORDED VOTE (SEE RIGHT) 

PECUNIARY INTEREST DECLARED 

WITHDRAWN 

25-236 BY PEGGY ROQUE – ROBERT CAMPBELL 

BE IT RESOLVED THAT the Council of the Municipality of Killarney 
supports the resolution passed by the Town of Port Colborne on June 4, 2025, 

which endorses Resolution No. 2025-185 from the Town of Bradford West 
Gwillimbury advocating for increased income support thresholds for Canadian 
veterans; 

FURTHER THAT this resolution be forwarded to all those noted in the 

resolutions passed by the Town of Port Colborne and the Town of Bradford 
West Gwillimbury. 

Resolution Result Recorded Vote 

Council Members 

Mary Bradbury 

Robert Campbell 

Dave Froats 

Nikola Grubic 

Michael Reider 

Peggy Roque 

YES NO 

□

□

□

□

□

□

CARRIED 

DEFEATED 

TABLED 

RECORDED VOTE (SEE RIGHT) 

PECUNIARY INTEREST DECLARED 

WITHDRAWN 

…/4 



July 9, 2025                                                 -4- 

25-237 BY ROBERT CAMPBELL – PEGGY ROQUE 

BE IT RESOLVED THAT the Municipality of Killarney grants Sarah Proulx 
an exemption to the noise by-law until 1 AM on Saturday, July 19th , 2025; 
                                                              

FURTHER THAT it is understood that this exemption may be rescinded if 
complaints are received from the community or if the 1 AM curfew is not 

adhered to. 

Resolution Result Recorded Vote 

Council Members 

Mary Bradbury 

Robert Campbell 

Dave Froats 

Nikola Grubic 

Michael Reider 

Peggy Roque 

YES NO 

□

□

□

□

□

□

CARRIED 

DEFEATED 

TABLED 

RECORDED VOTE (SEE RIGHT) 

PECUNIARY INTEREST DECLARED 

WITHDRAWN 

25-238    BY PEGGY ROQUE – ROBERT CAMPBELL 

BE IT RESOLVED THAT the Council of the Municipality of Killarney 

supports Resolution No. 2025-06-18-508 passed by the County of 
Northumberland on June 18, 2025, which endorses the resolution passed by the 

Township of Mulmur on April 2, 2025, calling on the federal and provincial 
governments to enact legislative changes to exempt municipalities from trade 
agreement restrictions while tariffs are in place, thereby allowing preference to 

Canadian suppliers for goods, services, and infrastructure projects; 

FURTHER THAT this resolution be forwarded to all those noted in the 

resolutions passed by the County of Northumberland and the Township of 
Mulmur. 

Resolution Result Recorded Vote 

Council Members 

Mary Bradbury 

Robert Campbell 

Dave Froats 

Nikola Grubic 

Michael Reider 

Peggy Roque 

YES NO 

□

□

□

□

□

□

CARRIED 

DEFEATED 

TABLED 

RECORDED VOTE (SEE RIGHT) 

PECUNIARY INTEREST DECLARED 

WITHDRAWN 

25-239    BY ROBERT CAMPBELL – PEGGY ROQUE 

BE IT RESOLVED THAT the Municipality of Killarney accept the Killarney 

Lagoons Wastewater Treatment Facility Operations and Maintenance Manual 
as prepared by Pinchin Ltd. dated June 6th , 2025. 

Resolution Result Recorded Vote 

Council Members 

Mary Bradbury 

Robert Campbell 

Dave Froats 

Nikola Grubic 

Michael Reider 

Peggy Roque 

YES NO 

□

□

□

□

□

□

CARRIED 

DEFEATED 

TABLED 

RECORDED VOTE (SEE RIGHT) 

PECUNIARY INTEREST DECLARED 

WITHDRAWN 

25-240     BY PEGGY ROQUE – ROBERT CAMPBELL 

BE IT RESOLVED THAT the Municipality of Killarney has no objections to 
the request submitted by the Killarney Volunteer Fire Department Association 

and further grants an exemption to the noise by-law until 1:00 AM on the 
following date: 

              Saturday, July 26th , 2025 
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FURTHER THAT it is understood that this exemption may be rescinded if 
complaints are received from the community or if the 1:00 AM curfew is not 

adhered to; 

FURTHER THAT all supplies from the Fish Fry MUST be removed from the 
Sport’s Hut and the rink grounds MUST be cleaned and returned to its original 

state no later than Friday, August 1st , 2025; 

FURTHER THAT the KCC cement surface will be closed to the public until 

the clean-up of the area is complete. 

Resolution Result Recorded Vote 

Council Members 

Mary Bradbury 

Robert Campbell 

Dave Froats 

Nikola Grubic 

Michael Reider 

Peggy Roque 

YES NO 

□

□

□

□

□

□

CARRIED 

DEFEATED 

TABLED 

RECORDED VOTE (SEE RIGHT) 

PECUNIARY INTEREST DECLARED 

WITHDRAWN 

25-241     BY ROBERT CAMPBELL – PEGGY ROQUE 

BE IT RESOLVED THAT the report from the Public Works Department for 
the month of June 2025 be accepted and filed. 

Resolution Result Recorded Vote 

Council Members 

Mary Bradbury 

Robert Campbell 

Dave Froats 

Nikola Grubic 

Michael Reider 

Peggy Roque 

YES NO 

□

□

□

□

□

□

CARRIED 

DEFEATED 

TABLED 

RECORDED VOTE (SEE RIGHT) 

PECUNIARY INTEREST DECLARED 

WITHDRAWN 

25-242     BY PEGGY ROQUE – ROBERT CAMPBELL 

BE IT RESOLVED THAT the report from the Financial Department for the 

month of June 2025 be accepted and filed. 

Resolution Result Recorded Vote 

Council Members 

Mary Bradbury 

Robert Campbell 

Dave Froats 

Nikola Grubic 

Michael Reider 

Peggy Roque 

YES NO 

□

□

□

□

□

□

CARRIED 

DEFEATED 

TABLED 

RECORDED VOTE (SEE RIGHT) 

PECUNIARY INTEREST DECLARED 

WITHDRAWN 

25-243    BY ROBERT CAMPBELL – PEGGY ROQUE 

BE IT RESOLVED THAT the Task Tracking Form for the month of June 
2025 from the Project Coordinator be accepted and filed. 

Resolution Result Recorded Vote 

Council Members 

Mary Bradbury 

Robert Campbell 

Dave Froats 

Nikola Grubic 

Michael Reider 

Peggy Roque 

YES NO 

□

□

□

□

□

□

CARRIED 

DEFEATED 

TABLED 

RECORDED VOTE (SEE RIGHT) 

PECUNIARY INTEREST DECLARED 

WITHDRAWN 
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25-244     BY MARY BRADBURY – NIKOLA GRUBIC 

WHEREAS all new municipal employees and Killarney Volunteer Fire 

Department recruits are required to submit a successful Vulnerable Sector 
Check (VSC) prior to beginning employment or volunteer service; 

AND WHEREAS the Ontario Provincial Police (OPP) currently face a 

significant backlog in processing VSC applications, resulting in extended wait 
times; 

THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED THAT the Municipality of Killarney will 
accept proof of application for a VSC from the OPP, along with a signed 
declaration from the applicant affirming that they have not been charged with 

or convicted of a criminal offence; 

AND FURTHER THAT once both documents are submitted along with other 

required documentation, the individual may commence employment or 
volunteer duties with the Municipality, pending receipt of the final VSC. 

Resolution Result Recorded Vote 

Council Members 

Mary Bradbury 

Robert Campbell 

Dave Froats 

Nikola Grubic 

Michael Reider 

Peggy Roque 

YES NO 

□

□

□

□

□

□

CARRIED 

DEFEATED 

TABLED 

RECORDED VOTE (SEE RIGHT) 

PECUNIARY INTEREST DECLARED 

WITHDRAWN 

25-245     BY NIKOLA GRUBIC – MARY BRADBURY 

BE IT RESOLVED THAT on the recommendation of Fire Chief Campbell, 

and contingent upon meeting the qualifications outlined in the Municipal 
Position Description for a Volunteer Fireground Support Person, the following 

individual is hereby appointed to the Killarney Volunteer Fire Department in 
that capacity, pending submission of all required documentation: 

• Curtis Henderson – Fireground Support Personnel 

AND FURTHER THAT this appointment is subject to a six (6) month 

probationary period, during which the appointee must complete any training 
and examinations as required by the Fire Chief; 

AND FURTHER THAT the appointee shall not perform duties as a Volunteer 

Fireground Support Person until all conditions of appointment are fulfilled. 

Resolution Result Recorded Vote 

Council Members 

Mary Bradbury 

Robert Campbell 

Dave Froats 

Nikola Grubic 

Michael Reider 

Peggy Roque 

YES NO 

□

□

□

□

□

□

CARRIED 

DEFEATED 

TABLED 

RECORDED VOTE (SEE RIGHT) 

PECUNIARY INTEREST DECLARED 

WITHDRAWN 

25-246     BY MARY BRADBURY – NIKOLA GRUBIC 

BE IT RESOLVED THAT the quarterly report from the Fire Chief for the 
months of April, May and June 2025 be accepted and filed. 

Resolution Result Recorded Vote 

Council Members 

Mary Bradbury 

Robert Campbell 

Dave Froats 

Nikola Grubic 

Michael Reider 

Peggy Roque 

YES NO 

□

□

□

□

□

□

CARRIED 

DEFEATED 

TABLED 

RECORDED VOTE (SEE RIGHT) 

PECUNIARY INTEREST DECLARED 

WITHDRAWN 
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25-247     BY NIKOLA GRUBIC – MARY BRADBURY 

BE IT RESOLVED THAT the Tax & Utility Receivables Report from the 
Tax/Utility Clerk dated June 10th , 2025 be accepted and filed. 

Resolution Result Recorded Vote 

Council Members 

Mary Bradbury 

Robert Campbell 

Dave Froats 

Nikola Grubic 

Michael Reider 

Peggy Roque 

YES NO 

□

□

□

□

□

□

CARRIED 

DEFEATED 

TABLED 

RECORDED VOTE (SEE RIGHT) 

PECUNIARY INTEREST DECLARED 

WITHDRAWN 

25-248     BY MARY BRADBURY – NIKOLA GRUBIC 

BE IT RESOLVED THAT the Memo Re: Innovative Property Tax/Utility 

Practices from the Tax/Utility Clerk dated July 3rd, 2025 be accepted; 

AND FURTHER THAT Council hereby directs the Tax/Utility Clerk to 
investigate Pre-Authorized Payments and the iCity Online eBilling initiative 
and report back once the research has been completed for Council’s review and 
consideration. 

Resolution Result Recorded Vote 

Council Members 

Mary Bradbury 

Robert Campbell 

Dave Froats 

Nikola Grubic 

Michael Reider 

Peggy Roque 

YES NO 

□

□

□

□

□

□

CARRIED 

DEFEATED 

TABLED 

RECORDED VOTE (SEE RIGHT) 

PECUNIARY INTEREST DECLARED 

WITHDRAWN 

25-249     BY NIKOLA GRUBIC – MARY BRADBURY 

BE IT RESOLVED THAT the minutes of the Killarney Health Centre Board 
meeting held June 26th, 2025 be accepted and filed. 

Resolution Result Recorded Vote 

Council Members 

Mary Bradbury 

Robert Campbell 

Dave Froats 

Nikola Grubic 

Michael Reider 

Peggy Roque 

YES NO 

□

□

□

□

□

□

CARRIED 

DEFEATED 

TABLED 

RECORDED VOTE (SEE RIGHT) 

PECUNIARY INTEREST DECLARED 

WITHDRAWN 

25-250     BY MARY BRADBURY – NIKOLA GRUBIC 

BE IT RESOLVED THAT the minutes of the Attainable Housing Working 
Group Regular Meetings held June 10th and June 25th , 2025, and the Public 

Meeting held June 25th , 2025 be accepted and filed. 

Resolution Result Recorded Vote 

Council Members 

Mary Bradbury 

Robert Campbell 

Dave Froats 

Nikola Grubic 

Michael Reider 

Peggy Roque 

YES NO 

□

□

□

□

□

□

CARRIED 

DEFEATED 

TABLED 

RECORDED VOTE (SEE RIGHT) 

PECUNIARY INTEREST DECLARED 

WITHDRAWN 
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25-251     BY NIKOLA GRUBIC – MARY BRADBURY 

BE IT RESOLVED THAT the Second Quarter Building Report from the 
Sudbury East Building and By-law Services Department (SEBBS) be accepted 

and filed. 

Resolution Result Recorded Vote 

Council Members 

Mary Bradbury 

Robert Campbell 

Dave Froats 

Nikola Grubic 

Michael Reider 

Peggy Roque 

YES NO 

□

□

□

□

□

□

CARRIED 

DEFEATED 

TABLED 

RECORDED VOTE (SEE RIGHT) 

PECUNIARY INTEREST DECLARED 

WITHDRAWN 

25-252    BY MARY BRADBURY – NIKOLA GRUBIC 

BE IT RESOLVED THAT the first draft of the Backyard Hen By-law from the 
Sudbury East Building and By-law Services Department (SEBBS) be accepted; 

FURTHER THAT Council direct Staff to post the draft by-law on the 
municipal website for public consideration and comment, with feedback to be 

collected and presented to Council along with Staff recommendations in a 
second draft by-law to be brought forward in October 2025. 

Resolution Result Recorded Vote 

Council Members 

Mary Bradbury 

Robert Campbell 

Dave Froats 

Nikola Grubic 

Michael Reider 

Peggy Roque 

YES NO 

□

□

□

□

□

□

CARRIED 

DEFEATED 

TABLED 

RECORDED VOTE (SEE RIGHT) 

PECUNIARY INTEREST DECLARED 

WITHDRAWN 

25-253    BY   MARY BRADBURY – NIKOLA GRUBIC 

BE IT RESOLVED THAT the report from the Project Coordinator dated July 
3, 2025, regarding the Rural Ontario Development (ROD) Program, be received 

and acknowledged; 

AND FURTHER THAT Council direct the Project Coordinator to explore 

grant opportunities under the ROD Program for Community Infrastructure 

Enhancements; 

AND FURTHER THAT Council consider the redevelopment of the Channel 
Marina property and Launch Ramp which are key tourism assets, as well as the 
development of a streetscaping plan for the beautification of Channel Street. 

Resolution Result Recorded Vote 

Council Members 

Mary Bradbury 

Robert Campbell 

Dave Froats 

Nikola Grubic 

Michael Reider 

Peggy Roque 

YES NO 

□

□

□

□

□

□

CARRIED 

DEFEATED 

TABLED 

RECORDED VOTE (SEE RIGHT) 

PECUNIARY INTEREST DECLARED 

WITHDRAWN 

25-254    BY   NIKOLA GRUBIC – MARY BRADBURY 

BE IT RESOLVED THAT upon the recommendation of the Personnel 
Committee and management, the Municipality of Killarney hire the following 

individuals for the specified seasonal positions, contingent upon meeting all job 
requirements and the submission of a successful Vulnerable Sector Check (VSC); 
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AND WHEREAS the VSC must be submitted to the Clerk prior to the 

commencement of employment, although the Clerk is hereby authorized due to 
significant processing delays by the O.P.P. to accept proof of application for a VSC 

along with a signed declaration affirming that the individual has not been charged 
with or convicted of a criminal offence: 

MAINTENANCE LABOURERS – PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT: 

• Griffen Bauer 

Tentative Start Date: July 21st , 2025 – program runs for up to 16 weeks 
Wage: Will be the Hourly Rate set out in the approved Canada Summer Jobs    

             Application 

• Riley Mercier 

Tentative Start Date: July 21st , 2025 – program runs for up to 16 weeks 
Wage: Will be the Hourly Rate set out in the approved Canada Summer Jobs 

            Application 

Resolution Result Recorded Vote 

Council Members 

Mary Bradbury 

Robert Campbell 

Dave Froats 

Nikola Grubic 

Michael Reider 

Peggy Roque 

YES NO 

□

□

□

□

□

□

CARRIED 

DEFEATED 

TABLED 

RECORDED VOTE (SEE RIGHT) 

PECUNIARY INTEREST DECLARED 

WITHDRAWN 

25-255    BY   MARY BRADBURY – NIKOLA GRUBIC 

BE IT RESOLVED THAT the Long-Term Care (LTC) Committee be placed 

on hold for the time being, to be reinstated at a later date as required; 

FURTHER THAT Council direct Staff to prepare and issue a letter of 

appreciation to the LTC Committee members, thanking them for their service. 

Resolution Result Recorded Vote 

Council Members 

Mary Bradbury 

Robert Campbell 

Dave Froats 

Nikola Grubic 

Michael Reider 

Peggy Roque 

YES NO 

□

□

□

□

□

□

CARRIED 

DEFEATED 

TABLED 

RECORDED VOTE (SEE RIGHT) 

PECUNIARY INTEREST DECLARED 

WITHDRAWN 

25-256    BY   MARY BRADBURY – NIKOLA GRUBIC 

BE IT RESOLVED THAT By-Law #2025-26 being a by-law to Authorize the 
Mayor and Clerk to Execute a Limited Services Agreement (Unopened Road 

Allowance) with Tim & Janice Roque be read a first and second time. 

Resolution Result Recorded Vote 

Council Members 

Mary Bradbury 

Robert Campbell 

Dave Froats 

Nikola Grubic 

Michael Reider 

Peggy Roque 

YES NO 

□

□

□

□

□

□

CARRIED 

DEFEATED 

TABLED 

RECORDED VOTE (SEE RIGHT) 

PECUNIARY INTEREST DECLARED 

WITHDRAWN 

25-257    BY   NIKOLA GRUBIC – MARY BRADBURY 

BE IT RESOLVED THAT By-Law #2025-26 being a by-law to Authorize the 
Mayor and Clerk to Execute a Limited Services Agreement (Unopened Road 

Allowance) with Tim & Janice Roque be considered read a third time and 
passed in Open Council this 9th day of July 2025. 
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Resolution Result Recorded Vote 

Council Members 

Mary Bradbury 

Robert Campbell 

Dave Froats 

Nikola Grubic 

Michael Reider 

Peggy Roque 

YES NO 

□

□

□

□

□

□

CARRIED 

DEFEATED 

TABLED 

RECORDED VOTE (SEE RIGHT) 

PECUNIARY INTEREST DECLARED 

WITHDRAWN 

25-258    BY   MARY BRADBURY – NIKOLA GRUBIC 

BE IT RESOLVED THAT By-Law #2025-27 being a by-law to Regulate and 
Prohibit Non-Compliance with Blasting Activities under Ontario Provincial 
Standard (OPSS) OPSS.MUNI 120 be read a first and second time. 

Resolution Result Recorded Vote 

Council Members 

Mary Bradbury 

Robert Campbell 

Dave Froats 

Nikola Grubic 

Michael Reider 

Peggy Roque 

YES NO 

□

□

□

□

□

□

CARRIED 

DEFEATED 

TABLED 

RECORDED VOTE (SEE RIGHT) 

PECUNIARY INTEREST DECLARED 

WITHDRAWN 

25-259    BY   NIKOLA GRUBIC – MARY BRADBURY 

BE IT RESOLVED THAT By-Law #2025-27 being a by-law to Regulate and 

Prohibit Non-Compliance with Blasting Activities under Ontario Provincial 
Standard (OPSS) OPSS.MUNI 120 be considered read a third time and passed 

in Open Council this 9th day of July 2025. 

Resolution Result Recorded Vote 

Council Members 

Mary Bradbury 

Robert Campbell 

Dave Froats 

Nikola Grubic 

Michael Reider 

Peggy Roque 

YES NO 

□

□

□

□

□

□

CARRIED 

DEFEATED 

TABLED 

RECORDED VOTE (SEE RIGHT) 

PECUNIARY INTEREST DECLARED 

WITHDRAWN 

25-260    BY   NIKOLA GRUBIC – MARY BRADBURY 

BE IT RESOLVED THAT By-Law #2025-28 being a by-law to confirm the 
proceedings of Council be read a first and second time. 

Resolution Result Recorded Vote 

Council Members 

Mary Bradbury 

Robert Campbell 

Dave Froats 

Nikola Grubic 

Michael Reider 

Peggy Roque 

YES NO 

□

□

□

□

□

□

CARRIED 

DEFEATED 

TABLED 

RECORDED VOTE (SEE RIGHT) 

PECUNIARY INTEREST DECLARED 

WITHDRAWN 

25-261 BY   MARY BRADBURY – NIKOLA GRUBIC 

BE IT RESOLVED THAT By-Law #2025-28 being a by-law to confirm the 
proceedings of Council be read a third time and passed in Open Council this 9th 

day of July 2025. 
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Resolution Result Recorded Vote 

Council Members 

Mary Bradbury 

Robert Campbell 

Dave Froats 

Nikola Grubic 

Michael Reider 

Peggy Roque 

YES NO 

□

□

□

□

□

□

CARRIED 

DEFEATED 

TABLED 

RECORDED VOTE (SEE RIGHT) 

PECUNIARY INTEREST DECLARED 

WITHDRAWN 

25-262    BY   NIKOLA GRUBIC – MARY BRADBURY 

BE IT RESOLVED THAT we adjourn the Regular Meeting of Council held 
July 9th, 2025 at 6:02 P.M. to meet again on August 13th , 2025 at 5:00 P.M. in 

person as well as by electronic means i.e. ZOOM. 

Resolution Result Recorded Vote 

Council Members 

Mary Bradbury 

Robert Campbell 

Dave Froats 

Nikola Grubic 

Michael Reider 

Peggy Roque 
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                                                       ORIGINAL DOCUMENT SIGNED 

       D OORIGNAL DOCUMN T ….................................................... 
                                                                             Michael Reider, Mayor 
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DOCUMENT SIGNED                                        ....................................................... 
                                      Candy Beauvais, Clerk-Treasurer 




